
PUBLIC NOTICE

Sale of deed Agreement Lost between
builder and first purchaser

Notice is hereby given to the Public that the 
Agreement for Sale dated 18/01/2006 between 
M/s. D. B. Construction & Mr. Sanjay Singh 
& Jt. vide Document No. BLN4-00512-2006 
for the flat being Flat No. 101, Krishna sadan 
CHS Ltd., Near Panchratna Park, Off. Mira 
Bhayander Road, Mira Road (E), Dist: Thane 
has been lost/ misplaced. All the persons are 
hereby informed that not to carry on any 
transaction on the basis of said missing 
document. On behalf of the client, Mr. 
Ravindra Udhav Singh (owner of the mentioned 
flat), the undersigned advocate hereby invites 
claims or objections, if any, for the transfer of 
said flat. In case of any claims/objections 
kindly intimate the undersigned advocate 
alongwith the relevant documents to support 
their claims/objections within 14 days from 
the date of publication of this notice. In 
absence of any claim within stipulated period, 
it shall be deemed that the property has no 
claim by virtue of lost agreement.

PUBLIC NOTICE

Place: Mira Road, Thane
Date:  01/09/2017

Notice is hereby given to the Public that the 
Agreement for Sale dated 18/01/2006 between 
M/s. D. B. Construction & Mr. Sanjay Singh 
& Jt. vide Document No. BLN4-00512-2006 
for the flat being Flat No. 101, Krishna sadan 
CHS Ltd., Near Panchratna Park, Off. Mira 
Bhayander Road, Mira Road (E), Dist: Thane 
has been lost/ misplaced. All the persons are 
hereby informed that not to carry on any 
transaction on the basis of said missing 
document. On behalf of the client, Mr. 
Ravindra Udhav Singh (owner of the mentioned 
flat), the undersigned advocate hereby invites 
claims or objections, if any, for the transfer of 
said flat. In case of any claims/objections 
kindly intimate the undersigned advocate 
alongwith the relevant documents to support 
their claims/objections within 14 days from 
the date of publication of this notice. In 
absence of any claim within stipulated period, 
it shall be deemed that the property has no 
claim by virtue of lost agreement.

Sd/- 
 Shaheen Patel

Advocate High Court
Heritage Apartments

Sir PM Road, Fort,
Mumbai - 400001
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